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Finance Minister Nirmala
Sitharaman said on Tuesday
that she hopes negotiations
on free trade agreements
with the US and the EU will
conclude soon. She rejected
allegations that India is a
high tari� country. The FM’s
remarks come at a time when
the deadline for the 90-day
pause period for the US re-
ciprocal tari�s is nearing an
end.

Addressing a Trade Con-
clave organised by India
Exim Bank, she said India
had already signed free trade
agreements with the UAE,
Australia and the 4-nation
EFTA (European Free Trade
Association) bloc, and nego-
tiations have been com-
pleted with the UK. “With
the US and the European

Union, negotiations are
really intensely going on and
should come to a conclusion
sooner,” she said, adding that
the emphasis now is on con-
cluding more free trade
agreements.

‘NO HIGH TARIFFS’ 

Rejecting the allegation that
India is a high tari� country,

Sitharaman said rationalisa-
tion of customs structure for
industrial goods had already
been done in the Budget.

“For those who still be-
lieve in the commentary
which was made in the US
that India may be the tari�
king, I want two things to be
remembered,” she said.
Elaborating on this, she said

given India’s system of
things, the government
seeks parliamentary ap-
proval for deciding on the
tari� rate and obtains from
Parliament the permission
to go up to a certain level, but
e�ectively, it is at a far lower
level. She qualified that the
e�ective tari� rate is far
lower but what gets pub-
lished in the gazette would
be that level for which you
obtained permission from
Parliament.

“Our procedures have
given us the not-so-desirable
picture of being very very re-
strictive and regressive
about tari�. Many of them
are already far lower than the
rate at which the gazette no-
tification comes after the ap-
proval of Parliament,” she
explained. 

Even after that, India re-
moved seven tari� rates in
the FY26 Budget. “For those

of us who still think there is
still a tari� story in India, I
want this to be clear that
there are only eight [tari�
rates], including the zero
rate,” she said, adding that
India had introduced a lot of
reforms in reducing the bur-
den on trade by cutting down
tari�s to support manufac-
turing, promoting exports
and facilitating trade.

TOTAL EXPORTS

Referring to the country’s
exports, the Finance Minis-
ter said that total exports of
goods and services had
reached a record high of $825
billion in FY25, achieving 6
per cent growth over the pre-
vious year. While global ex-
ports grew by only 4 per cent,
India’s exporters managed to
fast-track and cross growth
of 6.3 per cent despite global
uncertainties on the trade
front, she said.

India hopes to conclude trade deals 
with US, EU soon, says Sitharaman 
EASE OF TRADE. FM says India has introduced reforms to cut down tari�s to support manufacturing, exports

Shishir Sinha
New Delhi

REMOVING BARRIERS. India has removed seven tari� rates
in the FY26 Budget, said Finance Minister Nirmala Sitharaman

‘India welcomes ceasefire
between Iran and Israel’

New Delhi: Hours after US
President Donald Trump’s
claims of an Iran-Israel
ceasefire, India said on Tuesday
that it stands ready to play its
part to resolve the situation
and insisted on dialogue and
diplomacy as the way forward.
New Delhi said it welcomed
reports of a ceasefire between
Iran and Israel. “We have been
following developments
relating to the conflict between
Iran and Israel, including the US
action against Iran’s nuclear
facilities and Iranian retaliation
against US military bases in
Qatar,” said the Ministry of
External A�airs. PTI

QUICKLY.

The government on Tuesday
reiterated that duopoly in
the telecom sector is not
good, and that there must be
intense competition in every
sector. 

Speaking at an event of the
Broadband India Forum
(BIF), Telecom Minister
Jyotiraditya Scindia said
there is intense competition
in the country among inter-
net service providers (ISPs),
and the government will is-
sue rules for delicensing 6
gigahertz spectrum before
August 15, which will be used
for wi-fi services and
bridging the digital divide.

“Our job is to provide as
many avenues as possible
and within each vertical as
well provide intense compet-
ition. It’s not good enough
having a duopoly of one car-
rier or two carriers,” said
Scindia.

4G AND 5G SERVICES

At present, the Indian tele-
com sector is being domin-
ated by Bharti Airtel and Re-
liance Jio, who are actively
providing 4G and 5G ser-
vices. Debt-ridden Voda-
fone-Idea has expressed ap-
prehension on its survival in
a petition filed before the Su-
preme Court, and State-run
BSNL is yet to roll out 4G
and 5G services at a pan-In-
dia level.

Scindia said the country
has fibre technology for
broadband, WiFi and soon
there will be satellite ser-
vices with three companies,
including Reliance Indus-
tries-led SES joint venture,
Airtel-Oneweb and Starlink,
getting licences to provide
satcom services in the
country.

The Minister said spec-
trum will be soon assigned to
these companies on an ad-
ministrative basis. “Our re-

sponsibility is towards 1.4
billion of our country’s
brothers and sisters. Our job
is to provide every opportun-
ity to them. Our job is to
provide every technology to
them. Our job is to make sure
that Moore’s law operates in
the economic sphere. That is
as volume rises, prices fall,”
said Scindia.

LOWEST TARIFF RATES

He noted that India had the
lowest tari� rates for com-
munication services. For in-
stance, earlier 1 GB mobile
data used to cost ₹287, which
has now come down to ₹9
per GB, while the world aver-
age cost per GB is $2.49.

Scindia also appealed to
device makers and chip com-
panies to produce devices at
a nominal cost to allow Indi-
ans connect with broadband.

“We cannot allow devices
to become the new digital di-
vide in our country. If you
look at the three compon-
ents of this space — ter-
restrial fibre, satellite con-
nectivity and devices at
nominal cost — all three rep-
resent the bouquet that
presents the opportunity for
our countrymen and women
to power forward and innov-
ate their lives,” he added.

Duopoly in telecom sector
not good; there must be
stiff competition: Scindia 

Our Bureau
New Delhi

We cannot allow
devices to become
the new digital 
divide in our country
JYOTIRADITYA SCINDIA

Telecom Minister

The International Energy
Agency (IEA) has warned
that the boom in consump-
tion of auto fuels in India,
particularly petrol and avi-
ation turbine fuel (ATF), is
largely debt-fuelled, and
raised concerns that rising
household debt may impact
the usage trend.

The IEA, in its latest re-
port, projected that India’s
expected 1 million barrels
per day (mb/d) increase in oil
demand growth is the largest
for any single country over
2024-2030. 

This growth will be led by
petrol and jet fuel, which is
due to a rising middle class,
coupled with aspirational
spending.

“A risk to our outlook is
that the consumption boom
driving demand for India’s
transport fuels is to a large
extent debt-fuelled. Borrow-
ing has become increasingly
commonplace among India’s
middle class. Household

debt rose to 43 per cent of
GDP in 2024, up from 35 per
cent in 2022, and a possible
credit spiral could derail ex-
pansion,” it added.

HOUSEHOLD DEBT

Recently, the Reserve Bank
of India (RBI) said that even
as household debt is rising,
the increase is driven by a
growing number of borrow-
ers rather than an increase in
average indebtedness.

The stock of household
financial liabilities, including
personal loans and credit
card debt, amounts to
₹120.96 lakh crore as of

March 2024. The Central
bank, in its Financial Stabil-
ity Report (December 2024),
said at 42.9 per cent of GDP
(at current market prices) in
June 2024, India’s household
debt is relatively low com-
pared to other EMEs; how-
ever, it has increased over
the past three years. 

Borrowing by individuals
in the household sector con-
stituted around 91 per cent
of the stock of household fin-
ancial liabilities as of end-
March 2024, RBI added.

“Disaggregated analysis of
the nature of individuals’
borrowings shows that loans

are primarily used for con-
sumption (personal loans,
credit cards, consumer dur-
able loans and other per-
sonal loans), asset creation
(mortgage loans and vehicle
loans and two-wheeler
loans) and for productive
purposes (agriculture loans,
business loans and education
loans),” it pointed out.

As per Ministry of Statist-
ics and Programme Imple-
mentation (February 28,
2025), the compound aver-
age growth rate (CAGR)
between FY20 and FY24 in
household gross disposable
income and private final con-

sumption expenditure (at
current prices) is 10.1 per
cent and 10.3 per cent, re-
spectively. 

MIDDLE CLASS RISES

An expanding middle class,
coupled with growing a�u-
ence, is pushing up con-
sumption of petrol and jet
fuel, the two commodities in
the auto fuel segment, which
will help the top crude oil im-
porter lead global oil demand
growth. 

The demand for the two
auto fuels, which points to
the evolving dynamics in the
personal mobility and aspir-
ational air travel segments, is
aided by an expanding eco-
nomy and commercial base,
besides rising household en-
ergy consumption.

GLOBAL ANOMALY

Moreover, while all key
products will contribute to
the expansion, transport
fuels will lead the gains – a
global anomaly, IEA said. In
relative terms, jet/ kerosene
will rise fastest at almost 6
per cent annually. 

‘Rising household debt may impact auto fuel consumption’
Rishi Ranjan Kala
New Delhi

Amid the rare earth crisis, In-
dia is exploring sourcing
from Australia, Brazil, Japan
or Vietnam, in addition to
boosting local production
through a subsidy scheme
for the industry in the next
15-20 days, said HD Ku-
maraswamy, Minister of
Heavy Industries, on Tues-
day. 

“We are working on it
[rare earth magnet crisis].
Midwest, a Hyderabad-based
company, has shown interest

and they are targeting 500
tonnes of rare earth magnet
production by this year-end
and next year, they are aim-
ing for 5,000 tonnes produc-
tion,” Kumaraswamy told re-
porters here.

CABINET APPROVAL

Senior o�cials at the Min-
istry of Heavy Industries said
stakeholder consultations
were underway to determine
the quantum of subsidy to be
o�ered under the new
scheme and, if the total in-
centives involved are over
₹1,000 crore, then the
scheme will be sent to the

Cabinet for approval. The
rare earth magnet crisis is
hurting the automotive in-
dustry, which is heavily de-
pendent on China, a country
that has monopoly on pro-
duction and has placed re-
strictions on supplies.

Rare earth magnets in-
clude neodymium-iron-
boron (NdFeB). It is used for
high-performance automot-
ive applications, such as trac-
tion motors in electric
vehicles (EVs) and power
steering motors across
vehicle variants — EV, petrol
and diesel.

The government’s subsidy

scheme for local production
of magnets is part of a long-
term plan to secure supplies.
Indian Rare Earth Magnets
Ltd, a public sector unit un-
der the Ministry of Atomic
Energy, is the sole repository
of rare earths in India. 

“We do not know the
quantum of subsidy required
yet, stakeholder consulta-
tions are on... So, varied re-
sponses have come. Some-
body wants 50 per cent,
somebody wants 20 per cent.
So, it will be subject to a com-
petitive bid, then we will
know the quantum of sup-
port required,” said Kamran

Rizvi, Secretary, MHI.

PORTAL LAUNCHED

Meanwhile, the MHI
launched the portal for ac-
cepting applications under
the Scheme to Promote
Manufacturing of Electric
Passenger Cars in India (SP-
MEPCI), which will remain
open till October 21. 

Rizvi said MHI was writ-
ing to all countries having
automotive majors, includ-
ing Germany, the US, the
UK, Czechoslovakia and
their embassies for encour-
aging participation under
the scheme.

India may decide on rare earth magnet subsidy
scheme in the next 15-20 days: Kumaraswamy 
Ronendra Singh S
New Delhi

Union Labour and Employ-
ment Minister Mansukh
Mandaviya announced on
Tuesday that the EPFO has
enhanced auto-settlement
limit for advance claims
from ₹1 lakh to ₹5 lakh, en-
suring faster access to funds
for its members.

The EPFO first intro-
duced auto-settlement of ad-
vance claims during the
Covid-19 pandemic to
provide quick financial as-
sistance. 

Subsequently, the facility
was extended to cover ad-
vance claims for illness, edu-
cation, marriage and housing
purposes. 

These claims are pro-
cessed automatically by the
system without any human
involvement, ensuring quick

turnaround and transpar-
ency. Within three days, the
application for withdrawal of
funds will be settled.

“Another People-Centric
Move under Modi Govern-
ment,!” Mandaviya posted
on X. “EPFO enhances Auto-
Settlement Limit for Ad-
vance Claims from ₹1 Lakh
to ₹5 Lakh, with fast-track
disbursal now within 72
hours,” he posted on the so-
cial media platform.

FUNDS VIA ATM, UPI

The Ministry is also working
on a project which will allow
EPFO subscribers to with-
draw their employees’
provident fund (EPF) dir-
ectly from their accounts
through ATMs or other
modes such as UPI after link-
ing their bank accounts with
EPF. 

A certain proportion of
the EPF will be frozen and a

large chunk will be available
for withdrawal through bank
account using various
modes, such as UPI or ATM
debit cards, top Ministry
sources stated. 

SOFTWARE GLITCH

Some software challenges in
implementing this project
are being resolved, top
sources added. 

In FY25, the EPFO
achieved a significant mile-
stone by successfully pro-
cessing a record 2.34 crore
advance claims through
auto-settlement, reflecting a
sharp increase of 161 per
cent over the previous year,
said the Ministry of Labour
and Employment in a state-
ment. 

Notably, 59 per cent of all
advance claims in 2024-25
were settled through the
auto mode, the Ministry
stated.

EPFO enhances auto-settlement limit for
advance claims from ₹1 lakh to ₹5 lakh 
Dalip Singh
New Delhi

Anti-dumping duty on
four Chinese chemicals

New Delhi: India has imposed
anti-dumping duty on four
Chinese chemicals so far this
month to guard domestic
players from unfairly priced
imports from the neighbouring
country. These duties were
imposed on PEDA, Acetonitrile,
Vitamin -A Palmitate and
Insoluble Sulphur. In separate
notifications, the Central Board
of Indirect Taxes and Customs,
Department of Revenue, said
that the duty imposed will be
levied for five years on imports
of these chemicals. The duties
were imposed following
recommendations for the
same from the Directorate
General of Trade Remedies
(DGTR). PTI

Hindalco Industries, an
Aditya Birla Group company,
has acquired US-based
AluChem Companies Inc, a
manufacturer of specialty
alumina, for an enterprise
value of $125 million (about
₹1,075 crore). The acquisi-
tion will be carried out
through Aditya Holdings
LLC, a stepdown wholly
owned subsidiary of
Hindalco. 

AluChem brings Hindalco
a strong presence in North
America with an annual ca-
pacity of 60,000 tonnes
across its three advanced
manufacturing facilities in
Ohio and Arkansas. 

The company is a long-es-
tablished supplier of ultra-
low soda calcined and Tabu-
lar Alumina, materials

known for exceptional
thermal and mechanical sta-
bility used in high precision
mechanical components and
energy-intensive industrial
refractories. 

Hindalco operates 5 lakh
tonne of specialty alumina
capacity in India, and aims to
scale up to 1 million tonne by
FY30. It has alumina refiner-
ies in Belagavi (Karnataka);
Muri (Jharkhand); and Re-
nukoot (Uttar Pradesh),
with a modern refinery ded-
icated to specialty alumina
and hydrates in Belagavi. 

The AluChem transaction
is expected to close in the up-
coming quarter. As specialty
alumina finds newer applica-
tions across electric mobil-
ity, semi-conductors and
precision ceramics, the ac-
quisition provides access to
next-generation alumina ap-
plications and will drive
value-accretive growth.

Hindalco acquires US’
AluChem for $125 m 
Our Bureau
Mumbai
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In Line with BE, filys Hikes 
Passenger Fares from July 
M i n istry a im s  to rake i n  t92 ,800 er in current f i nanc ia l  year agai nst t80,000 er i n  prev ious FY 

Our Bureau 

New Delhi: Indian Railways 
has raised passenger fares 
marginally by half a paisa per 
kilometre (km) for second 
class travel beyond 500 km, ef­
fective July 1, first time since 
2020. officials said. 

ON TRACK 

Total expenditure of 
Railways for current 
fiscal is pegged at 
6.61 L crwhile it aims 
to earn 6.64 Lcr 

expected from ferrying 7 .57 bil­
lion passengers in fiscal 2025-
26 and 7 .27 billion in financial 
year20'24-25. 

lakh crore while it aims to 
earn fS.64 lakh crore during 
FY26. This translates to an op­
erating ratio of 98.43%, better 
than98.90% in FY25. 
Econom.ists ruled out any in-

flationary impact of the latest 
fare increase. 
'"The impact of passenger 

rail fare hike on inflation 
would be very minimal in my 
view,·· saidN RBhanumurthY, 
Director, Madras School of 
Economics. 

The increase would be 1 pai­
sa per km for mail express and 
2 paisa per km for air condi­
tioned(AC)classes.Suburban 
fares or monthly season tick­
ets have been spared any in­
crease. the3AC tickeL in line with Budget2025-26 es­

timates of U1e Railway Minis­
try that aims to rake in "9'2,800 
crore from passenger fares in 
the current fiscal. up from 
?80,000 crore in the previous 
financial year. 

By these projections, Indian 
Railways targets earning an 
average71 paisa per kilometre 
frompassengersin2025-26, up
from66paisa in FY24-25. 

In 2020. on a per km basis, 
the lndian Railways raised
2nd class fares by 1 paisa, 
Sleeper by 2 paisa. and AC 
category by 4 paisa. A steep• 
er hike was implemented in 
2013 when second class fares 
rose by 2 paisa, sleeper and 
2AC by 6 paisa, and other AC
categories by lOpaisa. 

For reference, the per km 
fare for a 3AC ticket from Del­
hi to Howrah is around tl.13 
per km right now. The base 
fare wi1l go up by around "30 
for thls trip, taking the esti­
mated revised fare tofi, 765for 

"These revised rates will be 
applicable from July l," a se­
nior official told ET. adding 
that tickets already booked 
will not be subject to revised 
fares. 

Total expenditure of the na­
tional transporter for the cur­
rent fiscal is pegged at f5.61 The latest increase in fares is The projected earnings are 
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FM COUNTERS 'TARIFF KING' ALLEGATION EFFORTS ON TO MITIGATE CRISIS: HOK 

US & EU Trade Pacts to be 

Concluded Soon: Sitharaman 

'Exploring Options for 
Rare Earths Supplies' 

Our Bureau 

New Delhi: The negotiations for a bi­
lateral trade deal with the United 
States and a free trade agreement 
with the European Union (EU) are 
progressing at a "fast pace and would 
be concluded soon", finance minister 
Nirmala Sitharaman said Tuesday. 
The minister countered the allega­

tion that India is a "tariff king" say­
ing that the government in the budget 
brought down the customs duty slab 
to eight and effective rate was much 
lower . .. . . .  with the US and the Europe­
an Union. negotiations are really in­
tensely going on and should come to a 
conclusion sooner." she said at a 
trade conclave organised by the Ex­
im Bank here. 
India has already signed free trade 

agreements with the United Arab 
Emirates, Australia, and 4-nation 
EFTA (European Free Trade Associ­
ation) bloc and negotiations have 
been completed with the UK. The em­
phasis now is on concluding more 
free trade agreements, she added. 
India has deepened its participa­

tion in global value chains. she said, 
adding, Apple India's iPhone con­
tract manufacturers have crossed 
the 20% domestic value addition 
(OVA) threshold across variants. Cit­
ing the United Nations Conference 
on Trade and Development (UNC­
TAD) World Investment Report 2025. 
she said. lndia's position has im-

TIME S 

proved though the global FDI Oows 
droppedll%.  

al EXPORT FOCUS 

While global exports grew 
by 4%,  Indian exports 
managed to fast-track and 

cross 6.3% despite global uncertain­
ties, the finance minister noted. In­
dia aims to achieve the export target 
of $2 trillion by 2030. 
"In the last few years, global growth 

and trade have all suffered. There 
was the Russia-Ukraine war. then it 
was Israel-Gaza. Every year we have 
had one or the other serious chal­
lenge to do with trade," the minister 
said. 
"Exporters arc swimming against 

tides and succeeding,'· she added. 
The finance minister said that the to­
tal exports reached an all-time high 
of $825 billion in FY25, recording a 
6% growth from the previous year. 
Speaking at the conclave, financial 

services secretary M Nagaraju said 
India continues to be a beacon of 
hope and growth amidst all the global 
headwinds. 
The International Monetary Fund 

(IMF) projects India to grow by 6.2%
in 1'"'Y26. Global gross domestic prod­
uct(GDP)isestimatedat2.8% in 2025. 

Despite global challenges, lndia is 
well positioned to capitalise on the 
emerging opportunities, given the 
trade partnerships, supported policy 
frameworks and the resilient export 
ecosystem, the secretary said. 

Our Bureau

New Delhi: India is exploring op­
tions to ease the ongoing disruption 
in supply of rare earth magnets, hea­
vy industries minister H D Kumaras­
wamy said Tuesday. ··we are working 
on it (addressing the rare earth mag­
net crisis)," the minister told repor• 
ters. 
·'Midwest, a Hyderabad-based com­

panY, has shown interest. They are 
targeting 500-tonne rare ea1ih mag­
net production by this year-end, ai­
ming for 5,000 tonne production in 
the next year," he said. 
Meanwhile, officials said an in­

centive scheme for rare earth mag­
nets is likely to be launched for sub­
sidising processing units. 
lndia ·s own rare earth magnet pro­

duction is also expected to increase 
inthecomingtwoyears,saidofficials 
aware of plans. Homegrown automa­
kers had red-flagged curbs on suppli­
es of rare earth-derived permanent 
magnets. Rare earth magnets are 
used in about a dozen critical parts 
used in electric ,1ehicle motors as 
well as vehicle speed detection and 
automatic gear shifting systems. 
Queried on the current situation, 

one of the officials said, .. As of today, 
things look better. Nobody has come 
back to us saying I am halting pro­
duction." 
Kumaraswamy's comments fol­

low a meeting earlier in the day bet-

ween national security advisor Ajit 
Do val and Chinese foreign minister 
Wang Yi in Beijing. 
ln a statement, a spokesperson for 

China'sforeignaffairsministrysaid, 
.. China and India should adhere to 
the important consensus that both Si• 
des are opport unit ies for each other's 
development, pose no tht·eat to one 
another, and are partners rather 
than rivals." 
Indian government officials furt­

her said domestic companies can al­
so import fully assembled compo­
nents from China without any rest­
riction. 
•• Existing government incentive 

schemes such as those for auto com• 
ponent and electric vehicle manufac­
turing already have exemptions for 
allowing these imports," another of­
ficial said. 
Besides importing minerals, India 

is also preparing to incentivise do­
mestic processing of rare earth supp­
ly chains. 
Explaining the need for incentives, 

the otTiciaJ said, "There is a hardly 
5% difference in prices of rare earth 
oxides and rare earth magnets . . .  Chi­
na wants to maintain its monopoly 
by keeping the price of magnets very 
low." 
As per official estimates, state-run 

LREL (India) can supply enough rare 
earths to make 1,500 tonnes of mag­
nets. "Converting U1ese rare earths 
to magnets will take two �·ears," the 
otTicial said. 

EPFO Raises Advance 

Withdrawal Limit to �5 L 
our Bureau

Poor Quality Data 
Inflates Welfare 
Outlay by 4-7%: Niti 

Our Bureau
I N T E G R A T I N G  S O L U T I O N S

IIIIIJ MATERIAL HANDLING .... 

New Delhi: The EPFO has raised the I imitfor ad­
vance withdrawal under the auto claim facility 
to f5 lakh from "1 lakh for exigencies such as ill­
ness, education, marriage, and housing purpos­
es, a move that will benefit over 70 mi1lion sub­
scribers of the retirement fund body. 

New Delhi: The ITI Aayog said Tuesday fiscal 
leakage and erroneous or duplicate beneficiary 
records due to poor quality data drain budgets 
and inflate welfare outlays by an estimated 4-7 % . 

ln the third edition of its quarterly insights se-

IIIIIJ INDUSTRIAL SERVICES ... 
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Following this, EPFO subscribers can get their 
advance withdrawal claims of up to ?5 lakh set­
tled within three days without any human inter­
vention, provided all required documents are in 
place. '"The EPFO has increased the auto-settle­
ment limit for advance claims from fl lakh to f5 
lakh to facilitate faster fund access for EPFO 
members, especially in times of urgent needs," 
labourandemploymentministerMansukhMan­
daviya said on Tuesday. 
The Employees' Provident Fund Organisation 

(EPFO) had first introduced online auto-settle­
ment of advance claims during the COVID-19 
pandemic to provide quick assistance to those 
facing financial crunch. 
Since then, the facility has been extended to cov­

er advance claims for illness, education, mar­
riage, and housing purposes. 
These claims are processed automatically by 

the system without an)• human involvement, en­
suring quick turnaround and transparency. 
According to the minister, EPFO processed a re­

cord 23.4 million advance claims in FY '25 
through auto-settlement, an increase of 161 % 
compared to 8.95 mi1lion claims settled in FY24. 

"59% of all advance claims in 2024-25 were set­
tled through auto mode as compared to 31 % in 
2023-24," he said. 

ries, Future Front. titled 'India's Data lmperati• 
ve: The Pivot Towards Quality', the govern­
ment's think tank called for f txing owne.rship for 
data at all levels, ensuring interoperability of da­
ta and incentivising quality data rather than qu­
antity to fortify digital governance, cultivate
public trust. ensure efficient service delivery 
and reduce leakages in the system. 
'"Policy blind spots, inconsistent, non.standardi­

sed datasets distort evidence. leading to mis-targe­
ted schemes or delayed course-corrections," the re­
port said. "Public trust erosion, citizens confron­
ting mismatched records. rejected claims, or end­
less rectification queues lose confidence in digital 
governance." 
The report, prepared by the Aayog in partners­

hip with Hyderabad-baseddata science company 
Gramener, outlined challenges in data use across 
the entire value chain including storage, use, 
sharing and retirement of data. 
"Quality suffers when data has no clear ownet 

The fix lies in assigning stewardship, not just for 
compliance, but for ongoing care," it said, sugges­
ting designating data custodians at each level (na­
tional,state,district)whoareempoweredandacco­
untablefordata health. 
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CBIC Extends NOC Validity for 
Imported Alcoholic Beverages 
New Delhi: The Central Board of Indi­
rect Taxes and Customs has extended 
validity of NOC for imported alcoholic 
beverages bottled at origin or in bulk 
with overl0% alcohol content. 

M . 9054533480 I ac@ h ightechshoes . com

The move follows a June 13 order by the 
Food Safety and Standards Authority of 
India clarifying Uiat such consignments 
without expiry date will have a NOC va­
lidity of 365 days under the FSS (Import) 
Regulations, 2017. Consignments remai­
ning in customs areas beyond 365 days 

can get revalidation afler a visual in­
spection and payment of the requisite 
inspection fee. The CBIC has instructed 
customsauthoritiesto sensitiseotTicers 
about the updated provision and advi­
sed stakeholders to communicate any 
implementation issues to the board. 
The move is aimed at streamlining cle­

arance and handling of imported alco­
holic beverages, easing logistical hurd­
les and improving supply chain predic­
tability for importers. -Our Bureau 

Distribution of rainfall in 726 d istricts June 1-23
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Forecast on June 25 
Conditions are 
favourable for 
further advance of 
Southwest monsoon 
over some more parts 
of Rajasthan, Punjab, 
Haryana; Delhi and 
remaining parts of 
West Uttar Pradesh in
next 36 hours 
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MoSPI Gets Real with AI: 
Surveys to Use Chatbots 

Anoushka Sawhney

New Delhi: The statistics ministry is integra­
ting artificial intelligence (Al) into its opera­
tions, with Al-enabled chatbots becoming 
part of key surveys, to provide accurate and 
UJ)•tO•date data to policymakers to help them 
make evidence-based policy decisions, the mi­
nister said. 
··To facilitate self-compilation by enterprises 

in the web-portal based Capex survey, an Al-po­
weredchatbothas been integrated into thepor• 
tal," Rao lnderjit Singh, minister of state (in­
de�ndent charge) for statistics and program­
me implementation, told ET. "This chat bot as­
sists respondents by providing guidance on 
the concepts used across various sections of 
the survey questionnaire," he explained. 
The Capex survey tracks capital expenditu­

re trends of private enterprises. The ministry 
of statistics and programme implementation 
(MoSPI) uses Al and machine learning-enab­
led chatbots for the Annual Survey of Unin­
corporated Sector Enterprises (AS USE) too. 
The ministry is also introducing new surve­

ys and updating existing ones to better reflect 
present-day economic and social realities, 
Singh said. The idea is to leverage technology 
to provide timely data to help the government 
bring in policies to improve quality of life of In­
dians and realise Vik.sit Bharat 2017. 
A pilot study on the unincorporated const­

ruction sector is scheduled for July- Decem­
ber, while a Household Income Survey will be 
launched from February 2026 to estimate the 

average income of rural and ur­
ban households, Singh said. 
The Periodic Labour Force 

Survey (PLFS) methodology 
was revamped in January. Un-

MlnlSte, Rao derthe new framework, r�ports 
lnderjltSln&h are relea�ed mont�ly, with ru­
sald thatnew ral data included m quarterly 
surveys are 
alsobeln& 
Introduced 
andexlstlnc 
ones are 
belnc 
updated 

releases. Annual reports will 
follow the calendar year rather 
than the earlier July-June cy­
cle . .. The updated PLFS design 
will allow(with state participa­
tion) generation of annual dis­
h·ict level estimates for most
districts across India. It is also 

planned to release ASUSE results quarterly 
instead of annually,·· Singh said. 
MoSPI is set to launch two new surveys from 

July - National Household Travel Survey 
(NHTS) and Domestic Tourism Expenditure 
Survey(DTES). 
NHTS aims to assess the spatial origin desti­

nation matrix for different transportation 
modes and influencing factors affecting the 
mode. destination choice, the price elasticity 
of travel demand by mode. 
The data will be used by the government and 

the railways ministry for transport planning, 
the minister said. 
OTES will gather information on trip purpo­

se, mode of transport, accommodation, final 
destination within the countrY, and tourism­
related expenditure. This will help the tou­
rism ministry to prepare the next Tourism Sa­
tellite Account (TSA), Singh said. 

P U B L I C  NOT I C E  

Notice i s  hereby g iven to the publ ic a t  large that our cl ient proposes to 
a c q u i r e A M G  I N F O  PA R K  P R I VAT E L I M I T E D  ( C I N :
U70200MH201 0PTC204622) (formerly known as LEELA LACE INFO
PARK PRIVATE L IM ITED/ CARN IVAL INFO PARK PRIVATE 
LIM ITED), a private l im ited company i ncorporated under the Companies
Act, 1 956. having its registered office at 1 1 0 1 /A-Wing. 1 1 th Floor, 
Express Zone, Off Western Express Highway. Malad East. Mumbai ,
Maharashtra - 400097, by way of a Share Transfer Agreement. 
The said company is i n  possession of unconstructed plain leasehold
land measuring 1 acre and 97 cents (1 .97 acres) comprised in
Re-Survey No.66-part of Pangappara, Thiruvananthapuram Ta l uk,
Thiruvananthapuram District, demarcated as Plot No. 77, situated within
Phase 1 Campus of Electro n i cs Tech no logy Parks-Kera l a
(TECHNOPARK), held o n  lease for a period o f  9 0  years . 
All persons having or cla iming any right, t i t le ,  interest, or claim
whatsoever in respect of the said company, its shareholdings ,  and/or the
aforesaid leasehold property, whether by way of sale, gift, inheritance,
transmission, mortgage, charge, lien, trust, possession,  easement, 
attachment, or otherwise, are hereby requested to make the same
known in writi ng, together with all supporting docu ments, to the
undersigned at the address g iven below within 10 (ten) days from the
date of publication of this notice.
If no such c la im is received with in the sti pu lated lime. the proposed
transaction shall be completed without any reference to such c la ims,  and
any such claims . if any, shall be deemed to have been waived and shal l
not be entertained thereafter. 

(Sd/-) Adv. BIJOY P. PULIPRA 

ARTIS LAW HOUSE, Advocates & Attorneys 
Ground Floor, TC No. 1 1 /789( 1 )  Old,  25/1 896 (New),

Plamoodu,  Nalanda J unction Road ,
Nanthancode, Kowdiar P.O . ,  Kera la - 695003

Place: Thi ruvananthapuram Emai l :  i nfo@artis lh .com
Date: 25.06.2025 

�"}) G H CL Registered Office : GHCL House, Opp. Punjabi Hall, Navrangpura. Ahmedabad-380009 
• -■::f!t ii IS.1 (Gujarat). Phone : 07!}-2642781 8, 26427519. {CIN : L 1 8101GJ2020PLC114004) 

Emai l : sea-etarial@ghcl'.extiles.co. in;Website : www.ghcltextiles.co.in 

GHCL Textiles Limited 

NOTICE OF 5TH ANNUAL GENERAL MEETING, REMOTE E-VOTING INFORMATION 
In continuation to our previous advertisement published on June 1 1 ,  2025 and June 12 ,  2025, NOTICE is hereby
given that the 5th Annual General Meeting (AGM) of the Company will be held on Monday, July 2 1 ,  2025 (-mq!ffl, 
�-1i8"��. � m  ,oc�) at 1 0.00A.M. (ISn throughVideo Conferencing (VC) orOtherAudio-Visual 
Means (OAVM). 
In accordance with the circulars issued by the Ministry of Corporate Affairs (MCA) and the Securities and Ex:change 
Board of India (SEBI) , companies are permitted to conductAGMs through VC I OAVM without the physical presence 
of members at a common venue. Therefore, our Company has opted to hold the A GM via VC to diswss and transact
the business outlined in the Notice o!AGM dated May 05, 2025 
In compliance'Mth the circulars, Company has sent the notice of the 5th AGM alongwith we blink to access the Annual 
Report of the Company for the financial year 2024-25 on Monday, June 23, 2025, through electronic mode, to all the
members whose email addresses are registered with the Company / RTA I Depositort Participants. Further, in 
accordance with Regulation 36(1)(b) of the SEBI listing Regulation 2015 , a letter providing weblink including the 
exact path and QR code for accessing the Notice of the 5thAGM and Annual Report for the financial year2024-25, has 
been sent to those shareholders whose email ids are not registered with the Company I RTA( DP through courier. 
These dOC\lments are also accessible on Company's website (www.ghdlextiles.co.in) . as well as on the websites
of BSE limited (www.bseindia.com). National Stock Exchange of India limited (www.nseindia.com). and CDSL 
e-voting platform {www.evotingiodia .com\. 
As per the cut-off date, which is July 14 ,  2025 (Monday), the voting rights of the members will be determined based on 
their shares in the paid-up equity share capital of the Company. To facilitate the voting process, Central Depository 
Services limited (COSL) will provide the option for members to cast their votes through an electronic voting system, 
known as "remote e-voting .• The Notice of the AGM indudes information on the process and procedure for remote
e-voting, as well as instructions for participating in the AGM through video conference. 
The remote e-voting period for the 5th A GM will commence on Thursday, July 1 7 , 2025 al 9:00 a.m. (1ST) and ends on 
Sunday, July 20, 2025 at 5:00 p.m. (lsn. During this period. members of the Company may electronically cast their 
votes on the agenda items specified in the Notice. The e-voting module will be diS<1b!ed after the end of the voling 
period and no further changes lo the casted votes will be allowed. 
Additionally, members attending the meeting will have the option to vote through the electronic voting system 
during the AGM. However, the members, who have already casted their votes through remote e-voling will be able 
to attend the meeting but will not be elig ible to vote again. Detailed instructions for members regarding remote 
e-voting were provided in the AGM Notice and the newspaper advertisement published in this regard on June 1 1 ,
2025 and June 12, 2025. 
If you have any queries or issues regarding e-voting, we have provided resources to assist you. You can refer to the 
Frequently Asked Questions (FAQs) and e-voting manual available at www evo�oqindia com under the help section. 
Additionally, you can reach out for support by sending an email to he!pdesk.eyoling@cdsl india.com or by calling 
1800225533. Altematively, you may contact the concerned employees of CDSL at 022-23058543 I 23058542 
between 10:00 a.m. to 6:30 p.m. from Monday to Friday. 
For any grievances related to electronic voting , you can contact to Mr. Ganapati Hal igouda, MUFG lnlime India 
Private Limited (Formerly Link lnlime Ind� Private limited), C101 ,  247 Par1c, L B. S. Marg, Vikhroli (West), Mumbai 
400083, Phone : +91-8108116767, Email : mt.helodesk@in mormJI!Yf!LQQ!Il 
We kindly request Iha! send your queries at least seven days in advance of the meeting lo ensure that the information 
can be made available and addressed during the meeting. 
Your engagement and participation are highly valued, and we are here to provide assistance and support throughout
the e-voling process. For GHCL Textiles Limited 
Place : Noida La!it Narayan Owivedi 
Date : June 24, 2025 Company Secretary (Membership No. F10487) 
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KANORIA CHEMICALS & INDUSTRIES LIMITED

Registered Office: 'KCI Plaza', 23C, Ashutosh Chowdhury Avenue, Kolkata - 700 019 
Phone: (033) 4031 3200, CIN: L24110WB1960PLC024910  

Email: investor@kanoliachem.com Website: www.kanoriachem.com 
Transfer of shares to Investor Education and Protection Fund (IEPF) pur1uant to Section 
124{6) and 125 of the Comp51ies Act, 2013 raad with IEPF (Accounting, Audi� Transfer and Refund) 
Rules2016aumendedardSEBl (llsOngObllgatlonsand DiscloeureRaquinments)Ragulations,2015. 

Members are hereby informed that unclaimed dividend for the financial year ended 31" 
March, 2018 and the corresponding Equity Shares of the Company in respect of which 
dividend entitlements have remained unclaimed for seven consecutive years from the 
financial year ended 31" March, 2018 will be due for transfer to the Investor Education 
and Protection Fund of the Central Government (IEPF) on 15• October, 2025, pursuant to 
the provisions of Section 124 of the Companies Act, 2013, read with the Investor 
Education and Protection Fund Authority (Accounting, Audit, Transfer and Refund) Rules, 
2016 as amended. The names of the concerned Members and their folio numbers or DP 
I D  and Cl ient I D  num bers are ava i l able on the Company's website 
www.kanoliachem.com under the Section 'Investors'. Individual letters have also been 
sent to the concerned Members in this regard at their address registered with the 
Company. 
The aforesaid Members may lodge their claim, by sending letter duly signed by the 
shareholder accompanied by Form ISR-1 , Form ISR-2, ISR-3, SH-13 or SH-14 as 
applicable (with original cancelled cheque leaf bearing the name of the shareholder), in 
respect of the above with the Company at its Registered Office at 'KCI Plaza", 23C, 
Ashutosh Chowdhury Avenue, Kolkata 700 O 19. In case any valid claim is not received by 
1 • September, 2025, the Company, in accordance with the aforesaid provisions of law, 
shall transfer such dividend and shares to the IEPF. Form ISR-1 , Form ISR-2, Form ISR-
3, SH-13 and SH-14 are available on the websites of Company as well as RTA at 
www.cbmsl.com 
After transfer of unclaimed dividend and shares to IEPF, the concerned shareholders may 
claim back the dividend and shares from I EPF as per the prescribed Rules. 
For further information in the matter or to claim the unclaimed dividend, concerned 
members may send email to the Company Secretary at investor@kanoliachem.com or 
calling the Registrar and Share Transfer Agent of the Company, C B Management 
Services (P) Ltd. at telephone number 033·6906 6200 or sending them email at 
rta@cbmsl.com 

Date : 24• June, 2025 
Place: Kolkata 

For Kanolia Chemicals & Industries Limited 
Sdl· 

Pratibha Jaiswal 
Company Secretary 

Membership No. ACS 33981 
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H�we[ HINDUSTAN OIL EXPLORATION COMPANY LIMITED 

EXPRESSION OF INTEREST 
UNDER INTERNATIONAL COMPETITIVE BIDDING 

Hindustan Oi l  Exploration Company Ltd. (HOEG) , the Operator of offshore Block 
PY· 1 in the Cauvery offshore and Blocks B·BO and B· 15 in the Mumbai High 
Western Offshore region, HOEG is planning to commence its drilling campaign 
starting from 03 of FY 2025-26 onwards. 
HOEG, seeks an Expression of Interest under International Competitive Bidding 
(1GB) procedures from suitably experienced Contractors for the Charter Hire of 
Offshore Jackup Rig; 
Offshore Jackup Rig Requirement. 
Independent Leg, Self·Elevating, Cantilever requirements skid: 70ft and 
Transverse: +/· 1 5ft, Water Depths: 250 - 300 ft, Suitable Hoisting and Deck 
Capacity to drill up to 4000 meters, Operating variable deck load of 7000·8000 
kips 
Only the Contractors satisfying the following criteria are invited to apply. 
• Capable of interfacing with the existing PY· 1 platform and B·80 subsea

intervention and drilling in B·80 field.
• Minimum 05 years' experience in executing Offshore Jackup Rig Contracts 

for Drilling Operations with above minimum capacity. 
• Availability of competent Jackup Rig personnel with IWCF and with a 

minimum of 1 0  years of experience in the Jackup Rig and Drilling
Operations.

• Minimum 05 years' experience in towing and mobilization of Jackup Rig at
offshore well locations and Minimum 05 years' experience in inter location
movement of Jackup Rigs.

• Corporate and Project Organizational Structure to handle Jackup and
Offshore Drilling Operations, Operational Manuals and Procedures.

• Corporate and Project Oriented HSE Structure, Procedures and Manuals,
Holds Accreditation and Certifications by competent authorities and IADC
Certification.

• Availability of Audited financial statements for the last three years.
Interested parties may submit their Expression of Interest to participate in the
tendering process along with contact details and requisite documents as 
mentioned above within 21 days from the date of publication. All responses
should be sent through soft/dig ital copy (procurement@hoec.com). The
subject of the soft copy shall be titled as "Offshore Jackup Rig • Prequalification
2025' and shall be addressed to:

Contracts and Procurement Department 
procurement@hoec.com 

Hindustan Oil Exploration Company Ltd. 
Lakshmi Chambers, 1 92, St. Mary's Road, Alwarpet, 

Chennai·60001 8, Tami l  Nadu, India 
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DISA INDIA LIMITED Q rl Can r U Regd. Office: World Trade Center (WTC), 6th Floor, Unit No. 5�4, Shaping 1"du,try Brigade Gateway Campus, 26/1, Dr. Rajkumar Road, 
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NOTICE 

s, all;il qe\o1 !RC, �1q;, l>lc,&1 5 � �"!lat lHi'.i,m la� ('btl \l�m �l'?!C� N OT I C E  Notice i s  hereby given that 64th ("Sixty.Fourth') Annual General Meeting 
('AGM') of the Members of Duncan Engineering Limited ('the Company') is
scheduled to be held on Thursday, July 24, 2025, at 1 1 .00 A.M. (1ST) through
video conference ("VG") / other audio visual means ("OAVM") to transact the 
business as set out in the Notice of the 64th AGM in compliance with all the 
appl icable provisions of the Compan ies Act, 201 3 and Rules issued 
thereunder and General Circular No. 0 9/2024 dated 1 9th September 2024 
issued by the Min istry or Corporate Affairs ("MCA") and Circu lar No. 
SEBI/HO/CFD/CFD•PoD•2/P/CIR/2024/1 33 dated 3rd October 2024 issued 
by the Securities and Exchange Board of I ndia ("SEBI"), along with other 
applicable Circulars issued in this regard by the MCA and SEBI . 

1116�>1 l;IEJ'atl� i?-t. dfili �101111 1c/l) [CIN : L65922DL2005PLC136029] ("��IS (For the attention of Members of DISA India Limited) 

5(sd') �Iii oll;>q :J,SCi f.9 ioli q1'tttli:l5 5c.t-i'l ;,Jl5211.s lfsz;,o1 1  'ol!El� <111£lsril ,5,l;>I 
8qj'ii <IIIQll el cl �- 17,79,443/-(�tq .. , �<R Ci llrl '1111>1e11�'lll l!'WI< '>11?�1 at11c.f1<1
�i) all q�.Jl >ii2 14.07.2025 oll  iJ"lS' �i"l'all 05.00 ell 06.00 q1, .. 1 E;>laicJlol "'Y>I ih .. i 
if ' ,  "'Pl i, � i," 'biol "� \ll'!I "l''li i," EJl;,e1 cl"-iqi'ii "'11q<i), i >ill\llCi icl�Ci 
(>/11,m>mf, Ptllcllilot >ill\ll(i 'btcil �Cilc.t(1tl!f Pll1rttPllif >ir.1.11 1<1ile!I c-ilot �!116.-e cri. 
HHLRAJ00453306 'ii c.mil alls<11cil 'i,_UJ ;,s,,, .;i;11'<>i� ( "lS''il eiik, 1  c".l2 "-!11<h, <iriki) cl>i 
"lS' 18.06.2025 �EJlo1i Qll"lS' <iriki ci1o1 .;iiJll>1u2 'biol 'oi<Ycl �c.i1£lc1 ci1o1 EMlcl"lS'( ciil)all 
�1<c11 :J,"lS'c.J 19.06.2025 ell "'1>ic.JI c.Jol cl>i c, 1:). t>i licl Qll"lS' (3�;,ic1 s1o!,_all ur,f 'biol "'1cr<1 
"-iil<h, <iriki ;,flsci).s1�2�ol <R>qq1o1 1 01151 all5cn f.9, 

In order to enab le sen d i n g  of not ices and oth e r  statutory 
communications to the Members in electronic form related to the Annual 
General Meeting for the Financial Year 2024-25 and in compliance with 
applicable provisions of the Companies Act, 201 3 and rules made 
t h e reunder  and  S E B I  (L is ti n g  O b l igat ions a n d  D i sc los u re 
Requirements) Regulations, 201 5, as amended from time to time read 
with all appl icable circulars issued by the Ministry of Corporate Affairs 
("MCA"), and the Securities and Exchange Board of India ("SEBI"), we
request the Members of DISA India Limited ("the Company"), who 
have not yet registered their email address to register the same as under: In compliance with the applicable MCA and SEBI Circulars, the electronic 

copy of the Notice of the AGM and the Annual Report for the Financial Year 
2024·25 will be sent via email only to those Members whose email addresses 
are registered with the Company, its Registrar and Transfer Agent (RTA), MUFG 
lnlime India Private Limited (formerly Link lntime India Private Limited), or their 
respective Depository Participants (DPs). 

<@c1 J.1i�if'<>lloll <lil�lol 'il;i_ 'olol l'id ls>id �- 11 ,21 ,000/· (�lq•u �><iR Cillll 'bl!i<ll<t 
l!'WI< �i) f.9 <!lei! 'olo1c2 >ia/l �1<1632 ("�sl") �. 1 ,12,100/· (�lqi!ll �5 Ci tlrl 611? 
(!'W1l 'bl5<tl �i) .;i2<'1 'ololl'ic1 �-<l 10 % oll <>t<lc.J«��I .  

�lq< f>lCi!t<1i qefot 
�".le cri. 305, .,fl-iJI >IICII, "'1:!) ����, (clo1 'bl, 'btll. 'bl�. ai, 579, �- 'bl�. q15 
ai. 18, 'lfl. 'bl�. ai. 2274/ 1 ,  'btl�I �15 \11�, ?l'l'!il2 • 360003, �"l'<IC1. 
i'l<.1 1e1a1 1  fc1cqc1 1<>1cJ>i1 <11ol �i:.c11 'ill @"< I  5;/1 W5cJ1s . 1152, .;i2& s

1 .  In respect of shares held in p hysical form, Members may 
update/register their email id by writing to the Company's Registrar 
and Share Transfer Agent ("RTA"), Integrated Registry Management
Services Private Limited, No. 30, Ramana Residency, 4th Cross, 
Sampige Road, Malleswaram, Bangalore • 560003, along with the 
duly filled in Form ISR·1 and other relevant documents. The fonmat of 
Form ISR·1 Is available on the website of the Company at 
https ://www . d  isagrou p .co m/en• i  n/i nvestor•relat ions/investor• 
grievances. 

The same will be available on the Company's website www.duncanengg.com 
and on the website of the Stock Exchanges on which the Company's shares 
are listed viz. BSE Limited www.bselndla.com 
Members can vote either through remote a-voling or e•voting at the time of 
AGM. Instructions for remote e•voting, e-voting at the time of AGM & procedure 
for attending the AGM through VC/OAVM facility for the Members holding 
shares in dematerialized mode, physical mode & for the members who have 
not registered their e•mail addresses will be provided in the Notice of the AGM. 

www.sammaancapital.com all clc.J<ilif2 '-fl '<>11'1c.JI lc:ls ?I ; <i'<8 al. 0124 • 691 091 o. 
+91 7065451024 ; if·>lc, "'11cJl51 : auctionhelpllne@sammaancapital.com. loil$01 '1i2
www.auclionfocus.in 1<;> c,101 'ollol 5'21. <t�/· 

'lll«lee1 'bt «ia1� 

2. In respect of equity shares held in electronic fonm, Members 
may update/register their email id with the concerned Depository
through their Depository Participant(s) with whom they maintain
their demat accounts.

ctlillrl : 19.06.2025 <t»11ot l!ri'.ieci la�s 
�Cll : ll"t!ile ('1111 \l�Cil �'ll'?!C� Ci16�01 !ilEfatl"<I la. afili 'l>IICIJllllcfl) 

3. For the l imited purpose of receiving shareholders notices and Annual
Report, Members may write to investor.relations@noricangroup.com.

In view of the above, Members are requested to register their e•mail address(es) 
or changes therein ,  if any, at the earliest, to receive aforesaid AGM Notice, 
Annual Report and login ID & password for e-voting electronically. Shareholders 
holding shares in dematerialized mode are requested to register their email 
addresses and mobile numbers with their relevant depositories through their 
depositary participants. Shareholders holding shares in  physical mode are 
requested to furnish the i r  email addresses and mobile numbers with the 
Company at complianceofficer@duncanengg.com or its R&T Agent at
pune@in.mpms.mufg.com. 

Place: Bangalore 
Date: June 24, 2025 

For DISA India Limited 
Shrlthee M S  

Company Secrelrary 

•::i,ad..,. &)>ft& ""14'i!I : .,., �& c-!Pllls, .,., �& o•l3i!I, .,,),; ilaeol .. !K!Mi!I c;,eil, i!ll«llt:>l llae, ,jot!/ - �ooo��-✓ 
""'" eil41ti : '!lllioS ��);t, &I ;t �'2 loif«.o•, llat)Stl �c-i!l\C�Stl �1i!) , �i!I& i!l5<1, cis)u1 - �0009 

._ YES BANK CIN : L651 90MH2003PLC1 43249, Email : communications@yesbank.in, Website : www.yesbank.in Pursuant to SEBI Circular dated November 3 ,  2021 (as amended by circulars 
di December 14, 2021 , March 16 ,  2023 & November 17, 2023), Shareholders 
holding physical securities are requested to note that if folio(s) are not updated 
with PAN, Choice of Nomination, Contact Details, Mobile Number, BankA=unt 
Details and Specimen Signab.Jre then any payment including dividend, in respect 
of such folios, will be effected only through electronic mode from April 1 ,  2024, 
upon furnishing of all the aforesaid details in entirety to R& T Agent. 

- . . 
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'j5Ci/dli!el>ti 'j58 I) �ath•- !tOl--1 .. �I <e al. 'j&i!i! CaOOIEli!all i!11rllt<1 i!llif.15Rli!Jl alElc� I), cl "�!l cnil !l", "� I) cl d" � "� !l <11I d'' all EIRe'l di. u.o ... 'IOIIL all i!)'l' a!Rl 
fA•lil« '3ll•c&<tl, i!le-iif.11i!&di, ..,,.1-iE•c) ...;i f3•c�lc) '¥1>t1aiE•i! �R).,1 ai1a'l fA•iilc• 011&1 clen &"•" E� ..,,..,. .,,� "!Wi!I 5ie<l• il"•ei &i>!'l).  

OE!aadr / BIiia$ ... atllld lelld Tax on Dividend: Pursuant to provisions of the Income Tax Act, 1 96 1  ('the 
Income Tax Act') as amended from time to time, dividend declared and paid 
by a Company is taxable in the hands of the shareholders and the Company 
is required to deduct Tax at Source ('TDS') from dividend paid to the shareholders 
at applicable rates. Therefore, the Company is required to deduct TDS at the 
time of making the payment of the said dividend and deposit the same to the 
credit of the Central Government. 
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,!M��lllot ls"'l"l!ie ;uiol � ls"'l"l!ie <ISIE.!t utlc't ;ui1clci 'i!t>t"J litCi5'd. atl '21'1' "1151 "'� •-.. --.. 
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❖ oils 11)5-eq1all �EEi! <11:ilui : 'l'l,O(o,i!Dilll ❖ lila&el ra.il;:n11all <1Rlut : Olo,Olo,i!Dilll
c;1.,1u1 �•loll Rl•1ct<lli! ,..,.,.) i!llol �li!d) <i'tci1 >1.Si!oi1oll 5;!).,) i!IINCi c-lT& https://www.yasbank.il1l'about•us/media/auction-property 1f-ti!i! c�mE1i! oil <loitillla 
www.yesbank.in i!ll"ICII https://sarfaesi.auctiontiger.net. �i!II) . . <it l-s;a s)�>)aa� tf-"11sl>1 �ac,)01 '1CIICl<ll>ti i!IIOl<ll ... , .. ., lite<5'd 'j5''2.! lit«&ctall loii!1'lt�l>ti d5'Ci1� 1:1),i ... � 5-)tf 5');t1 a)zi d) >t4i!Ol•at1 5''21� Ol'tl �& ..... _al l  i!llltl&Rlatl oitld
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Tax rate appl icable to a shareholder depends upon residential stab.ls and 
classification as per the provisions of the Act. All shareholders are thereby 
requested to update any change in residential status and/or category with DP 
(in case of shares held in electronic form) or with the R&T Agent (in case of 
shares held in physical form), as may be applicable, before the Cut-olf date 
i.e. July 1 7, 2025.
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UNITED BREWERIES LIM ITED 
Registered Office: U B  Tower, U B  City, #24 Vittal Mallya Road, 

Bengaluru • 560 001 . Phone: 080 • 45655000 
Fax: 080 - 2221 1 964, 22229488. GIN: L36999KA1999PLC0251 95 

Website: www.unitedbreweries.com, Emai l :  ublinvestor@ubmail .com 

NOTICE 

Shareholders' Notice for Transfer of Unclaimed Dividend and Equity Shares of the 
Company to Investor Education and Protection Fund (IEPF) Account 

NOTICE is hereby given to the Shareholders of United Breweries Limited ("the Company") that under Section 124(6) 
of the Companies Act, 2013  and the Investor Education and Protection Fund Authority (Accounting, Audit Transfer 
and Refund) Rules, 201 6 as amended (hereinafter referred to as 'the Rules'), all shares in respect of which dividend 
has not been claimed for seven (7) consecutive years or more, by any Shareholder(s) shall be transferred by the 
Company to the Investor Education and Protection Fund ("IEPF'). 
The unclaimed dividends have been transferred from time to time as per the applicable provisions of the Companies 
Act, 201 3  (hereinafter referred to as "theAcr) to the IEPF. The next due date for such transfer would be October 22, 
2025, regard ing the final dividend paid for the financial year ended March 31 , 201 8. Accordingly, the relevant shares 
also stand due to be transferred to IEPF on October 22, 2025. 
The Company has already sent an intimation at the latest available address individually to each of the Shareholder(s) 
whose shares are liable to be transferred to IEPF under the Rules, requesting them to take the necessary action on or 
before September 30, 2025. The full details of such Shareholders, including their name, folio number or DP ID· Client 
ID, and the number of shares (s) due for transfer, are also available at: Investors•> Investor Fact Sheet •> Unclaimed 
Shares Details •> Unclaimed Shares•Dividend 201 7·2018.  Shareholder(s) are requested to verify the details of their 
share(s) due to be transferred to the I EPF Authority. 
Notice is further given to all such shareholder(s) to foiward the requisite documents as mentioned in the aforesaid 
intimation to the Register and Transfer Agent on or before September 30, 2025, with a request for claiming the 
unclaimed dividend declared for the financial year ended March 31 , 20 18, so that the shares are not transferred 
to lEPF. 
In the event, no communication is received from such Shareholders, the Company will be constrained to transfer the 
shares to the DEMAT Account of the IEPF Authority in terms of the said Rules. The concerned Shareholder(s) holding 
shares in physical form and whose shares are liable to be transferred may note that the Company would be issuing 
Letter of Confirmation against shares held by them for the transfer of shares to IEPF Authority DE MAT Account as per 
the Rules and upon such issue, the original share certificate(s) which stands registered in their name will stand 
automatically canceled and be deemed non•negotiable. 
Shareholder(s) can claim backthe share(s) from the IEPF Authority so transferred as well as unclaimed dividends and 
corporate benefits accruing on such shares, if any, by following the process prescribed in the Rules. No claim shall lie 
against the Company concerning the unclaimed dividends and shares transferred to the IEPF under the Rules. 
In case Shareholder(s) have any query on the subject matter and the Rules, they may contact the Company's 
Registrar and Transfer Agent viz., Integrated Registry Management Services Private Limited, No.30, Ramana 
Residency, 4� Cross, Sampige Road, Malleswaram, Bengaluru - 560003 [Tel. Nos. 080-2346081 5-81 8  and 
Email: bglsta@integratedindia.in] 

Date : June 24. 2025 
Place : Bengaluru 

For UNITED BREWERIES LIMITED 
Sd/-

Nlkhll Malpanl 
Company Secretary and Compliance Officer 

ACS · 20869 

A detailed communication explaining the process on withholding tax on dividend 
paid to the members at prescribed rates along with the necessary annexures 
and guidance on updating PAN/ bank account details was sent by the Company 
to al l  those members whose email IDs are registered with the Depositories/ 
RTA on June 1 1 ,  2025. 
Application forms for claiming Nil or less rate of TDS by Resident Shareholders 
[such as Form 1 5G / Fonm 1 5H in case of individuals and self-declaration by 
entities] and by Non Resident Shareholders can be downloaded from the 
website of the Company viz., www.duncanengg.com. To enable us to determine
the applicable rate of TDS / withholding tax, you should submit necessary 
documents to the company at ashish.jain@duncanengg.com on or before 
July 1 0, 2025. No communication on tax determination / deduction shall be 
considered after July 1 0, 2025. Further the details are also available on the 
Company's website www.duncanengg.com and Stock Exchange website
www.bseindia.com. 

Place : Noida 
Date : 24.06.2025 

By the Order of the Board of Directors 
For Duncan Engineering Llm11ed 

Sd/· 
Shanu Gupta 

Company Secretary (Mem No A74877) 
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